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Abbreviations
BML: Biomaterial

BEL: Bioenergemal

BEG: Bioenergeme

BIFL: Biointerfacemal

BELC: Bioenergemal Communication

BIOCOM: Biocommunication

NMEGO: Neuromindego

UU: Unit Universe

Ints: Intuitions

Introduction
	 I propose the examination of imprinting resulting from sexu-
al abuse as a potential factor that may influence various outcomes, 
including homosexuality, stuttering, and autism in both men and 
women, serial murder syndrome and paraphilias (fetichism, exhibi-
tionism, pedophilia, voyeurism and other examples) [Ints 01/24 & 
03/10/2025]. It is suggested that imprinting originally triggered by 
sexual abuse might contribute to the development of these conditions. 
One possible sequence, among others, could involve the following: 
Sexual abuse imprinting (leading to imprinting of homosexuality) 
may be associated with imprinting of stuttering and autism in both 
men and women. These conditions, observed with an average ratio 
of four men to one woman, are known to be challenging to modify. 
These collective observations give rise to the imprinting syndrome 
of sexual abuse, serial murder syndrome and paraphilias (fetichism, 
exhibitionism, pedophilia, voyeurism and other examples) [Ints 01/24 
& 03/10/2025].

Imprinting Syndrome of Sexual Abuse
	 Imprinting refers to an early stage in an animal’s life, or a sensitive 
stage when it forms bonds and develops its own identity. Through 
sexual imprinting, young animals learn mate preferences at an early  
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	 I propose the examination of imprinting resulting from sexual 
abuse as a potential factor that may influence various outcomes, 
including homosexuality, stuttering, autism in both men and women, 
serial killer and paraphilias (fetichism, exhibitionism, pedophilia, voy-
eurism and other examples). It is suggested that imprinting originally 
triggered by sexual abuse might contribute to the development of 
these conditions. One possible sequence, among others, could in-
volve the following: Sexual abuse imprinting (leading to imprinting of 
homosexuality) may be associated with imprinting of stuttering and 
autism in both men and women. These conditions, observed with an 
average ratio of four men to one woman. Also, sexual killer behavior 
and paraphilias use to be related to child sexual abuse. All these 
effects are known to be quite challenging to modify. These collective 
observations give rise to the imprinting syndrome of sexual abuse. 

	 Through bioenergemal communication, we establish interaction 
with human BEGs that arrive at the BEL universe after people bio-
collapse (die). This BEL information does not intend to ratify or rectify 
the official version of these facts; it only presents the bioinformation 
that some BEGs shared with us. All invited BEGs agreed that their 
names and comments could be published.
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age by observing and learning to imitate their parents as role models, 
as is the case with humans and various other animal species. Natural 
sexual imprinting prevents consanguinity or mating with relatives, 
and avoids inbreeding or mating between close members of a com-
munity.

Summary of Surveys
	 A summary of surveys conducted in 2016 in several countries on 
heterosexuality and homosexuality in men and women concluded 
that, on average, 2% of men and 0.5% of women identify as exclu-
sively homosexual, resulting in a ratio of 4:1 for men and women. 
Additionally, 0.5% of men and 0.5% of women identify as predomi-
nantly homosexual, 0.5% of men and 1% of women as bisexual, 4% 
of men and 10% of women as mostly heterosexual, and 93% of men 
and 88% of women recognized themselves as exclusively heterosexu-
al [1]. This reflects the fact that 7% of men and 12% of women show 
variations in their sexual preferences. Homosexual variants occur in 
both sexes, and if preferred, they cannot easily modify a certain sex-
ual preference. In a 1997 survey in the United States, 46% of gay or 
bisexual individuals had a history of childhood sexual abuse, whereas 
only 12% did not. This study affirms: “Given these findings, it appears 
that being sexually abused as a child may affect the propensity of 
adult men to fantasize about young men [2,3].” 

Definition of Child Sexual Abuse
	 Sexual abuse is defined as any sexual activity involving a child 
who does not provide or cannot provide consent. It can be forced 
sexual contact or through threats, regardless of the age of those who 
participate, as well as any sexual contact between an adult (or an older 
boy or girl), either through deception or if the minor, boy or girl, un-
derstands the sexual nature of that activity. Under overcrowded condi-
tions, instances of homosexual rape have been reported to occur with 
greater frequency, such as in boarding schools and prisons [4,5]. 

Children Early Development
	 In children, sexual abuse can result in specific attachments and 
well-defined aversion. In addition, these children may perceive their 
sexual inclinations differently due to the absence of a consolidated 
heterosexual gender imprinting identity, which they may be unaware 
of and consider foreign to them [6]. This perception may result from 
aversive imprinting caused by the sexual abuse experience. Conse-
quently, individuals may perceive their bodies as incongruent with 
their sexual preferences, leading to rejection of their own physicali-
ty. Such perceptions can persist into adolescence, adulthood, and old 
age, with individuals perceiving their homosexual orientation as un-
changeable and normal. When the imprinting of the minor’s gender 
identity was preserved and coexisted with the imprinting resulting 
from sexual abuse, such as instances of short duration or lower inten-
sity (e.g., when it was a woman who groped the child’s anus), then 
the assaulted person could present both heterosexual and homosexual 
impulses or bisexuality. Some young homosexuals may conceal their 
sexual preferences, even resorting to extreme measures like suicide if 
they fear exposure. Homosexuality in adults may often be accompa-
nied by aggressive sexual impulses and harm to babies [7]. Homosex-
uality may attenuate or nullify reproduction, too [8].

	 Certain brain areas may be involved, including the inner face of 
the temporal lobes and a part of the limbic system. This system is 
a part of the brain involved in behavioral and emotional responses, 
especially when it comes to behaviors that we need to survive, such 
as feeding, reproducing, caring for our offspring, and fighting or flight 
responses. Additionally, the emotional register of experiences directs 
human existence involuntarily [9,10]. 

Political not Medical Decisions on Homosexuality 

	 Some people, both men and women, often ask for a sufficient-
ly clear and consistent explanation of the causes of homosexuality. 
However, the search was halted when in 1973 the American Psychi-
atric Association removed homosexuality from its list of mental dis-
orders. Ronald Bayer, author of what is considered the most explicit 
account of the 1973 decision, described what actually happened: “A 
furious egalitarianism that challenged every instance of authority had 
compelled psychiatric experts to negotiate the pathological status of 
homosexuality with homosexuals themselves. The result was not a 
conclusion based on an approximation of the scientific truth as dictat-
ed by reason, but was instead an action demanded by the ideological 
temper of the times [11].” They tried to normalize homosexuality and 
all they got was to normalize child sexual abuse, thereby leading to 
the affectation of any form of family nucleus.

Dubious Benefits of Therapies

	 Of course, there have always been psychotherapeutic approaches 
to homosexuality, from the psychoanalytic approach (which tries to 
help the person to make conscious the presumed unconscious causes), 
group psychotherapy (seeks improved general adjustment), to eclectic 
approaches like the Rational Emotive Therapy, or just psychotherapy; 
and, currently, from the criticized reconversion therapies (they seek 
to make the homosexual become heterosexual) to those that invite 
homosexuality to be seen only as a lifestyle choice. All these psycho-
therapeutic approaches claim to be effective depending on the person 
in question [12].

Acquired Stuttering

	 The imprinting of early sexual abuse may coincide with oth-
er sensitive stages of development, such as language learning [13]. 
It can interfere with language acquisition and impede the learning 
and expression of language. This interference can lead to acquired 
stuttering, which manifests as a result of panic and distress caused 
by the abuse [14]. Therefore, I propose that sexual abuse may not 
only impact sexual preferences in men and women but also affect 
language learning and expression. Thus, stuttering, as a consequence 
of imprinting difficulties, becomes challenging to overcome [15]. On 
average, this condition affects four adult males for every female (4:1 
ratio) [16]. This may reflect altered filial (familial) imprinting because 
the children learn language primarily from their parents [17]. Limbic 
imprinting can persist because of the many fears and humiliations 
faced by these individuals [18]. Some medications that antagonize 
the neurotransmitter dopamine are effective in reducing the severity 
of stuttering symptoms.

Stuttering and Autism

	 Autism is a neurodevelopmental disorder that arises during the 
first two years of life and persists for the rest of life. It is characterized 
by a wide variety of communication disorders, including restricted 
motor skills, limited social interaction, distractibility, impulsiveness, 
passivity, learning difficulties, and self-absorption as defeated. Au-
tism traits are so varied that specialists speak of autism spectrum dis-
order. There is no cure for autism, and support consists of helping 
individuals acquire habits that allow them to adapt to their limita-
tions or peculiarities, even with the help of medications. The typical 
frequency of autism in men and women is 4:1 or 3:1, respectively 
[19]. Simultaneous presentation of stuttering and autism has also been  
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reported, as has sexual abuse in children with autism. Imprinting 
forms the biological basis that researchers statistically detect when 
studying homosexuality, acquired stuttering, and autism.

Tourette Syndrome
	 Tourette’s Syndrome may be another more serious complication 
of childhood sexual abuse, which shares very similar symptoms with 
stuttering and autism, and also follows a 4:1 ratio for males and fe-
males. They occasionally behave in a sexopathic and or sociopath-
ic way [20-22]. In Tourette’s Syndrome, the imprinting of repeated 
sexual abuse can completely disorganize the personality. Without a 
doubt, child sexual abuse must be typified as one of the most serious 
crimes. If the exponential increase in the sexual abuse of children 
continues, the Western culture will end up destroying itself, just like 
those other cultures or institutions (religious, military, wild communi-
ties) that maintain this same practice.

	 Gender abuse is also relevant, and with results similar to sexual 
abuse, when, for example, the father and or the mother reject their 
baby because it is a girl or a boy. A similar response of rejection can 
be presented with stepchildren and even with adopted sons or daugh-
ters. In all these cases, parents or guardians usually respond with an 
impulsive aversive imprinting not only towards the sex of the babies 
but also against their existence.

	 This is how the relentless, stealthy, and hard-to-modify imprint-
ing syndrome of child sexual abuse is integrated. It is important to 
acknowledge that the determination of truth and falsehood can some-
times be influenced by dominant societal groups, prioritizing sub-
jective biases over research findings and consistent statistical data. 
Therefore, it is advisable to consider contrasting approaches and per-
spectives in the examination of these complex topics. The harmful 
concealment of the deceptive sexual culture in the West made an in-
dustry is evident [23,24].

Eating Disorders
	 BELC 08/26/2024. We are inviting 10 men and 10 women diag-
nosed with eating disorders such as bulimia and anorexia nervosa to 
participate in the BEG. How many of you suffered sexual abuse in 
childhood? Raise your hand. Men: “Six”. Women: “Eight”. Men, how 
was your NMEGO affected? “It was different, doctor, for each of us, 
but in general it made us feel that our body was unpleasant, our per-
son was inadequate, that we had to be very clean or very… giving an 
image that according to us did not correspond to reality or that we had 
to deceive and our mood was affected by making it variable… Well, 
we are… we want to please, but at the same time we hurt a lot and 
even though we don’t want to, we hurt ourselves… We also feel that 
it is easy for us to be hurt, rejected, devalued and suddenly we feel 
very overrated… Fear and guilt limit us, but sometimes we cannot 
limit ourselves to food… Our being becomes disorganized and that 
is how we live…” Women, how was your NMEGO affected? “Well, 
sometimes we feel like our existence is worthless, that no matter what 
we do, we are no longer whole. Sometimes we are our allies, but 
sometimes we are our enemies, and we constantly attack each other 
without being able to stop for a moment of peace. Sometimes, it’s a 
family that becomes a family of sexual abuse, and that separates ev-
eryone, individualizes them, and they can no longer integrate but at-
tack, sometimes with carelessness, apathy, or disorganization. These 
are ways we learn to treat each other. This means that sometimes we 
lie, or other times we are the most frank and sincere people, but fear 
scares us, and we once again create a shell and compensate through 
food or other addictions or obsessions… We get tangled up and don’t 
know how to untangle it; it’s a problem.” 

Suicidal
	 BELC 08/26/2024. We invited the BEG of 20 men and 20 women 
who have committed suicide. How many of you suffered sexual abuse 
in childhood? Raise your hand? Men: “Twelve”. Women: “Fifteen”. 
Men, was the sexual abuse that disastrous and intolerable for your 
NMEGO? “Doctor, that’s true, and even if it was just touching, there 
are those of us who experience it as an irreparable problem that tor-
ments us every night and sometimes even every day.” Alfredo Tor-
res Larios, a suicide researcher, feels spontaneously included in this 
group. Women, was the sexual abuse that disastrous and intolerable 
for your NMEGO? “Yes, doctor, because the vulnerable age you are 
at can be a factor for someone to attack you, underestimate you, and 
threaten you. They all want to be different, but end up looking and 
feeling different; even their own appearance is neglected to the point 
that it no longer matters, and it increasingly ceases to matter. Some 
agree sometimes, but we want to disappear through thinness, while 
others want to alienate others through obesity or some grotesque be-
havior. Some imitate us, but don’t know why we are that way.” Alfon-
sina Storni: “Doctor, regardless of whether a person who has suffered 
sexual abuse succeeds, it doesn’t negate the imprint of sexual abuse. I 
applaud your tireless work in raising awareness against sexual abuse 
and its normalization and indifference. The same thing happens to 
men and women, Doctor.” 

Effects on Humanity of Child Sexual Abuse
	 I insist that the global pandemic of sexual abuse of infants, girls, 
and boys, and the devastating effect its aftermath has had on the fam-
ily, on men, on women, and on humanity as a whole, will reach its 
growth limit of 10 billion inhabitants by the end of this 21st century, 
and in the 22nd and 23rd centuries will begin to decline as rapidly as 
its increase, reaching a limit of approximately 2 billion inhabitants 
in just 10 generations [25]. Not to mention that if one or more wars 
involving atomic bombs were to occur, the outlook for humanity’s 
survival would change drastically (they claim that in 1986 there were 
70,300 active atomic bombs, and that by 2024 there will be 12,121 
atomic bombs in the world [26]. In reality, it is not known, or they do 
not want to reveal, how many of these atomic weapons exist. They 
treat humanity as if it were made up of minors). Be careful of dicta-
tors…

Sociopaths-Psychopaths-Serial Killers Syndrome
	 BELC 08/26/2024. We are inviting to the BEG of 10 men and 10 
women diagnosed as psychopaths. How many of you suffered sexual 
abuse in childhood? Raise your hand. Men: “Ten”. Women: “Ten”. 
Men, how was your NMEGO affected? “We all experienced some 
form of sexual abuse, and we had to face the need to alter our be-
havior in a way that allowed us to confront or go against someone or 
something that violated our personality.” How severe is this diagno-
sis? “Just as severe as sexual abuse, the abuse is repeated, and that’s 
why it’s common to find NMEGO alterations in us. The experience 
isn’t shared, and a fantasy is created that we ourselves distort about 
our existence.” Women, how was your NMEGO affected? “Equally, 
10 of them raised their hands, and they all said the same thing, say-
ing that they had all experienced some form of sexual abuse. They 
confirm what the men said, although the forms of aggression vary, as 
do the types of victims sought. The origin is the same condition. And 
we also distort the situation because it will only be a form of pointing 
fingers, but not of understanding, given how grotesque the experience 
is. It is better to disconnect from our own existence than to live trying 
to correct it.” Correcting what can no longer be corrected… “Exactly, 
how can we correct that experience if we are convinced that we are 
going to be eliminated, attacked, and even worse, discredited? We  
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know that our fear is so great that we end up in the same circum-
stance.” 

	 BELC 09/01/2024, includes four sections. 1) We invite Madame 
Curie, Abdus Salam, and Esther to accompany us throughout the bio-
communication. We invite the BEG of 20 men and 20 women who 
have behaved, whether discovered or not, as serial killers. How many 
of you suffered sexual abuse in childhood? Raise your hand? Men: 
“Twelve”. Women: “Nine”. Men, was the abuse excessively cruel? 
“Yes, doctor, that’s how we lived it, and that’s why we don’t like to 
remember those difficult moments or intuit now about it.” How did 
your NMEGO lead you to commit serial homicides? “First, doctor, it 
feels as if we’re being seduced by a specific person from the outside, 
and we feel trapped by that person. Then we feel a sense of distrust 
and detachment. Then a very strong struggle begins between desire 
and passion and the base instincts of our sexuality, and this makes us 
feel terrible because we unleash all our resentment and fury, and that’s 
when we begin to devise a way to attack the other person. We don’t 
know how, and we lose ourselves, and it’s an unchangeable objec-
tive.” Mainly women? “Yes, doctor, mainly.” Men too? “We see men 
as allies, but also as enemies when they are allies of women. Howev-
er, it isn’t always the case. There’s a lot of dualities in what we think, 
in what we conceive.” Did you ever feel envy of some men? “Yes, 
doctor, sometimes terrifying and, at other times, lustful, because they 
can achieve what we want, they can achieve their goal.” Did you eat 
body parts of your victims? “Some of us did, but not all, but we did 
like having him/her around. Seeing what he/she had become.” What 
part of the body attracted you the most? “There isn’t one in particular; 
we like to feel like we can control it. But, at the same time, we realize 
now that we are the ones who are controlled.” How did your moth-
er’s or father’s partner participate in this sexual abuse as children? 
“It varies greatly because sometimes they are accomplices; they are 
the trash that takes the memories. Likewise, they don’t usually have 
that much… they tend to be selfish and distant.” Was there any finan-
cial arrangement by your father or mother for them to sexually abuse 
you? “Yes, doctor, sometimes yes, and other times we realized about 
their illness, which was transmitted to us. They harmed their child for 
money or for pleasure.” Were you children of an unwanted pregnancy 
by your parents? “Yes, doctor, we were children almost at the point of 
biocollapse” [death]. How many of you grew up with only your moth-
er? “Six”. How many of you grew up with only your father? “Two”. 
Two with both parents. Were you frequently threatened as children 
that you would be murdered? “Yes, doctor, we also experienced that 
from the womb, we lived it like that.” Did you live in a prison as a 
child? “Some of us did, but some of us lived like in a prison, and so 
we preferred the streets. Some of us lived there in the prison, and 
others, our mother later left [the prison]. Sometimes we preferred her 
to be locked up.” Did you choose your victims, or was it completely 
by chance? “It’s an attraction on both sides; at first, it’s by chance, 
and then we observe them; however, we’ve already chosen them. And 
we just need to get to know them to seduce them. And make them 
our allies.” What did you feel when you murdered someone? “Well, at 
first, a lot of fear, a lot of anger. It’s a very strong impulse that lasts 
until it’s carried out. Then comes a feeling of tranquility, somewhere 
between victory and enjoyment. But it’s also replaced later by a feel-
ing of emptiness.” Did you dedicate the crime to someone? “It’s up 
to each person, depending on what each person is looking for, what 
each person has experienced. For example, if someone experienced it 
as an offering, as a gift, then they surely did it because they owed that 
debt. They didn’t do it for themselves, but for someone else. When  

you don’t want to feel that deep emptiness, that’s when a third party 
gets involved and you can’t take it anymore, so you cover it up that 
way. The cases vary.” Did you cause the authorities to discover you? 
“Yes, doctor, there comes a time when our NMEGO can no longer 
plan, flee, or try to escape from itself.” What do you say about child-
hood sexual abuse? “Doctor, no one deserves to be treated with any 
type of abuse, much less sexual abuse. When sexual abuse occurs, 
it’s because other abuse has already taken place, and if not, it’s about 
to take place. In other words, it doesn’t happen alone... it leaves very 
deep wounds and the traits become more diverse, but it’s very diffi-
cult.” How does your BEG feel? “Currently, we feel like we’ve lived 
in that void we always wanted to escape, but the NMEGO deceived 
us because it was only temporary play. The NMEGO helps with that 
because [when biocollapsed], you lose it and that’s it, but you can’t 
escape from the BEG, but it’s empty.” Would you like to add anything 
else? “Thank you, doctor, for asking us this. It’s like filling the BEG 
with something different, we don’t know what it is, but it’s different.” 

	 Women, was the abuse excessively cruel? “All abuse, even if not 
excessive, is cruel. Some of us experienced it as more intense or cru-
el, and others experienced it very cruel, but we didn’t experience it 
that way. We all experienced it as cruel, senseless.” How did your 
NMEGO lead you to commit serial homicides? “Doctor, something 
inside us, our NMEGO, took hold of us without stopping us from 
achieving a goal. Faced with the difficulty of getting rid of that force, 
we let ourselves be carried away by the moment until we culminated 
in the murder and then another. It seemed like we didn’t need that 
force, but it becomes a condition, a personal motive.” As revenge? 
“Yes, as revenge or betrayal, yes, that’s how we experienced it, as 
revenge or betrayal.” The more vulnerable the person, the more this 
murderous tendency emerged? “Yes, doctor, because the more vul-
nerable the person, the more anger, resentment, and difficulty in stop-
ping it could arise.” Perhaps you were reliving your own vulnerability 
from when you were abused as children? “Doctor, we hadn’t seen 
it that way, but we certainly experienced that vulnerability, albeit in 
an inappropriate way.” Mainly men? Mainly women? Or both, wom-
en and men? “Well, it didn’t make any difference. Although there 
were mostly men, but women were also present.” Did you eat body 
parts of your victims? “Doctor, sometimes yes, with that feeling of 
resentment, hatred, revenge, there was that need, in other cases it only 
materialized in murder and the hiding of the body.” How did your 
mother’s or father’s partner participate in this sexual abuse when you 
were young? “In some cases, they do seem to have participated and 
been involved, yes, doctor, because those who were negligent partic-
ipated by doing nothing; they didn’t prevent what was happening.” 
Was there some financial arrangement by your father or mother for 
you to be sexually abused? “Certainly yes, it’s very common. If there 
wasn’t money, there was some merchandise, there was something in 
return, yes, they received it. Sometimes these people don’t have re-
sources either, but they steal it somehow.” Were you the children of an 
unwanted pregnancy by your parents? “Of course, Doctor, we were 
never wanted.” How many of you only knew your mother? “Twen-
ty.” Were you frequently threatened with murder as children? “Yes, 
doctor, some of us were even threatened with being expelled from 
our mother’s womb.” Did you live in prison as a child? “No, doctor, 
it was free time. Although we committed murders, some managed 
to evade that authority somehow.” Did you choose your victims, or 
was it completely by chance? “Of course we chose them; we fol-
lowed our own ideas and were clear about who we were looking for.” 
Mainly men? “Mainly, but women too.” What did you feel when you  
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murdered someone? “Satisfaction, from the moment you undertook 
that goal, letting yourself be driven by that desire.” Did you feel 
strong? “Yes, doctor, we felt strong, very motivated.” Did you en-
courage the authorities to discover you? “After several murders, we 
felt we were going to be an example, a demonstration that what we 
were doing was just.” Do you want to add anything else? “Nothing 
else, doctor.” 

Psychosis-Schizophrenia
	 BELC 06/22/2021. Using the Innovative BEL Instrument (IBI), 
100 random men from the current era were shown on the screen; 
What percentage of them were raped in childhood, adolescence, and/
or as adults: “70%.” One hundred random men from the Middle 
Ages: What percentage were raped? “80%.” One hundred random 
men from the 5th and 4th centuries before our era (boe; Homer, Her-
aclitus, Socrates): What percentage were raped? “70%.”

	 Using the IBI, 100 random women from the current era were 
shown on the screen; What percentage of them were raped in child-
hood, adolescence, and/or as adults: “80%.” One hundred random 
women from the Middle Ages: What percentage were raped? “80%.” 
One hundred random women from the 5th and 4th centuries boe: 
What percentage were raped? “80%.” 

	 Using the IBI, out of 50 men and 50 women diagnosed with 
schizophrenia, how many were raped before developing schizophre-
nia? Men: “50% (25).” Women: “60% (30).”

	 Using the IBI, out of 50 men and 50 women diagnosed with psy-
chosis, how many were raped before developing psychosis? Men: 
“60% (30).” Women: “60% (30).” 

	 Humanity is irreparably poisoned by child sexual abuse and its 
consequences [Ints 03/18/2025].

Members of the Military

	 2) We invite the BEG of 15 men and 15 women who have served 
in the military since they were recruits and privates. How many of you 
suffered sexual abuse in childhood? Raise your hand. Men: “Eight.” 
Women: “Ten.” Men, how was your NMEGO affected? “Doctor, of 
course, sexual abuse is an event that you carry with you, but some-
times the NMEGO doesn’t remember it, but it will manifest at 
some point.” Women, how was your NMEGO affected? “Doctor, the 
NMEGO is affected by sexual abuse, even if you forget it or don’t 
remember it.” 

	 How many of you suffered sexual abuse by members of the mili-
tary? Please raise your hand? Men: “Six.” Women: “Ten.” Men, how 
was your NMEGO affected by abuse in the military? “Doctor, after 
we’ve suffered abuse from a partner, as the level increases, it can be-
come more intense, for example, penetration. That’s why we make 
it seem consensual and then move on to more. So, we live with the 
ideal of staying there. At that moment, the ideal is the pursuit of that 
power.” What argument did sexual abusers use to abuse you? “Some-
times, yes. With that, they could break any rule and do whatever they 
wanted.” Did you become sexual abusers afterward? “Four of us did, 
some didn’t have those ideas in their NMEGO.” Women, how was 
your NMEGO affected by the abuse in the military? “Doctor, it affect-
ed you in different areas, mainly emotionally, but we never inclined 
to leave the military.” Why? “Because of our parents’ ideals, having 
a sense of defense, of power.” What argument did the sexual abusers  

use to abuse you? “Yes, doctor, always, that [the higher hierarchy] 
was the argument and the rest of us had to obey.” Did women also 
abuse you? “Yes, some did. The roughest ones sought out their vic-
tims and, in that way, managed to make the others submit, whatever 
their intentions.” Did you become abusers afterward? “Five of us did, 
it was inappropriate because we ourselves opposed it; it was just a 
whim, partly out of revenge, but we felt it was justice, and that’s how 
it should have been.” 

Drug Addicts

	 3) We invite the BEG of 15 men and 15 women who have been 
addicted to illicit drugs of all kinds (marijuana, cocaine, morphine, 
fentanyl, and whatever). How many of you suffered sexual abuse in 
childhood? Raise your hand? Men: “Ten”. Women: “Ten”. Men, how 
was your NMEGO affected? “Doctor, it inevitably transformed.” Do 
you mean it became useless? “Yes, doctor, it practically became in-
sensitive, there was no longer any contact with reality, it was like 
living like an automaton.” Women, how was your NMEGO affected? 
“Doctor, there really is no difference. It also affected us completely; 
our NMEGO no longer functioned properly.”

Alcoholics

	 4) We invite the BEG of 15 men and 15 women who have been 
alcoholics. How many of you suffered sexual abuse in childhood? 
Raise your hand? Men: “Eleven”. Women: “Eleven”. Men, how was 
your NMEGO affected? “Doctor, we lived in situations in which we 
lost our sense of reality, even our sense of existence; our projects 
collapsed.” Women, how was your NMEGO affected? “Yes, doctor. 
We radically abandoned what we, as human beings, women, mothers, 
should have done. Our existence is transformed.” 

Caroline Darian

	 In her book, And I Stopped Calling You Dad, Caroline Darian re-
counts the sexual abuse that her mother and other women suffered 
for years. Dominique, her father, prepared a cocktail of anti-anxiety 
drugs (benzodiazepines), tranquilizers (Lorazepam), and others with 
sedative side effects, which is what GHB (gamma hydroxybutyrate) 
or “liquid ecstasy,” known as the date-rape drug, works like. The 
abuser mixed this cocktail with wine and gave it to his wife to drink. 
He put her to sleep for hours, took photos and videos of her, and up-
loaded them to a website with vulgar captions, inviting his followers 
to come to his house and rape his wife while she slept, with the sole 
condition that he take photos and videos and charge them nothing. His 
mistake was taking upskirt photos of three women in a supermarket 
who had sued him. When the agents began investigating, they discov-
ered the entire abusive and perverse plot this man had been carrying 
out in France since 2011. Although less frequently, he did something 
similar with his only daughter, Caroline, with his two daughters-in-
law, and with other women, usually the wives of the rapists who had 
been invited. More than 50 rapists were arrested and convicted, rang-
ing from young adults to the elderly.

	 In her book, Caroline Darian comments: “Chemical submission in 
the family and social sphere is much more widespread than we think. 
This modus operandi is the preferred weapon of sexual predators. For 
the moment, we still lack reliable statistical data to prove it. Needless 
to say, in 2020, when my father was arrested, no one was talking 
about it!

http://dx.doi.org/10.24966/ACIM-7562/100425
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	 “Difficult to pinpoint, still poorly identified, insufficiently quanti-
fied, poorly diagnosed, and therefore with little institutional support, 
it affects a wide range of people, from women and sometimes men to 
children, even babies and the elderly, from all social strata. We know 
about GHB, …, but who could imagine that someone close to them 
could chemically abuse them, with drugs from the family medicine 
cabinet?

	 “From femicide to incest, the scandals of recent years show that 
cases of sexual violence often involve power dynamics that transform 
isolated incidents into systematic practices. Unfortunately, chemical 
submission is no exception: most victims are women, and nearly 70% 
of reported cases involve sexual assault. The private sphere is the first 
to be implicated in this type of violence [27].” 

Pope Francis

	 “…it is enough for even one case of abuse to come to light in the 
Church for it to become a monstrosity in itself. With shame and re-
pentance, the Church must ask forgiveness for the terrible harm these 
consecrated persons have committed by sexually abusing children, a 
crime that generates deep wounds of pain and helplessness, first and 
foremost in the victims, but also in their families and in the communi-
ty… No silence or concealment on this issue can be tolerated, neither 
outside the Church nor even within it. It is not a negotiable issue.” 

	 “These types of situations must always be taken very, very seri-
ously, without hesitation or underestimation.”

	 “The pain of the victims is a complaint that… has always been 
ignored, hidden, and silenced.” 

	 “This type of crime cannot be subject to a statute of limitations… 
Undoubtedly, those primarily responsible are those who commit the 
abuse, but if a bishop knows and does not act, he also becomes re-
sponsible. To cover up is to add shame to shame [28].” 

	 BELC 04/15/2025. We invited Pope Francis’s BEG. You have 
been one of the most consistent popes. In your work, you have always 
vindicated the institution, bringing it closer to the community, espe-
cially to those who suffer the most needs. This hasn’t happened for a 
long time. Agreed, Francis? “I thank you, doctor, for those words that 
should have been acted upon to vindicate the deteriorated religious 
vision.” If you agree, I would like to address some personal aspects. 
“Yes, Doctor, go ahead.” In elementary school, you had a conflict 
with your teacher, Lia. This led to a maternal reprimand at home 
that, in my opinion, was excessive, which you leave in ellipses, which 
speak louder than the description. This excessive maternal repres-
sion marked your relationship with her, your mother, right, Francis? 
“True, doctor, it was something surprising even for myself, but that’s 
how it happened.” Fortunately, you met Esther, an interesting chem-
istry teacher and very genuine and committed social activist. Right, 
Francis? “Right, doctor.” The most effective way to stop you from 
studying medicine was for your mother to suggest it. Agreed, Fran-
cis? He laughs and affirms: “Yes, doctor, that’s how it was.” Your 
reproaches to her were indirect. 1. By making you a pastor. 2. When 
your mother unexpectedly kneels before her already consecrated son. 
And, 3. By adopting, as a maternal figure, the support of the congre-
gation and what the institution represents. Was it like that, Francis? 
“Yes, doctor, that’s how it was.” And regarding the prevalence of sex-
ual abuse in the Apostolic See, what do you say? “Very regrettable 
and difficult to eliminate. In addition to the actions I’ve taken, much  

remains to be done.” Congratulations on your consistency, Francis. 
“Thank you, doctor.” What do you say about the BEL research? “I’m 
intuiting, doctor, and I find it very interesting, and indeed it fulfills the 
purpose it is intended to serve. The BEG as such hasn’t been consid-
ered, and it’s very timely and necessary to position it this way, since 
it clears out the prevailing ideas, and best of all, it has no limits. And 
well, the NMEGO is what sets the limits. This much I can tell you 
for now.” Would you like to add anything else? “There’s a pleasant 
atmosphere, very vectorized and calm.” Of all the biospecies… “Yes, 
doctor.” Be well, Francis, keep taking care of your lungs. “Yes, doc-
tor, we’ve done our part and I’m satisfied.” 

Conclusion
1.	 This is how the relentless, stealthy, and hard-to-modify imprint-

ing syndrome of child sexual abuse is integrated. It is important 
to acknowledge that the determination of truth and falsehood can 
sometimes be influenced by dominant societal groups, prioritizing 
subjective biases over research findings and consistent statistical 
data. Therefore, it is advisable to consider contrasting approaches 
and perspectives in the examination of these complex topics. The 
harmful concealment of the deceptive sexual culture in the West 
made an industry is evident.

2.	 Whatever the reasons for continuing to hide and deny the pan-
demic of child sexual abuse and its grave consequences, allowing 
them to continue growing along with their devastating effects, they 
constitute contempt for children and a lack of respect for humanity. 

3.	 Therefore, raising banners and arguments in defense of humanity 
and the new generations must be rejected as false and misleading, 
seeking only to continue pushing humanity toward a cataclysm 
with very serious and unstoppable consequences [29]. The worst 
calamity is the dictators of various countries who seek to impose 
their agenda on humanity.

4.	 Sexual hormones, uncontrolled by sexual abuse, distort their func-
tion and in this way will continue to affect humanity. 

5.	 Humanity is irreparably poisoned by child sexual abuse and its 
consequences [Ints 03/18/2025].
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